RFB #5-002 Awarded Musical Instruments and Supplies

Brook Mays
i i Days to Price per | Extended
Item 7 Item I:Ie_:r.nptinn. Qty. Delivery Unit Price
1 Music Stands - Wenger Bravo; Desk Color - Raspberry; 40 bid |
_______Frame Finish - Chrom ot el
2 Music Stands - Wenger Classic 50; Blacld 4 no bid |
3 Music Stand - Wenger Director's Stand; 30"x20 1/2 1 n.u:: bi d. g
transparent polycarbonate desk; Metalbase) = | -
Bassoon - Fox Model IV - Polypropylene body; Long bor .
4 with right hand whisper key lock} 2 $3,525.00 %7.050.00
Tenor Saxophone - Selmer Model 54 Super Action 8
5 : Series II; with case 1 $3,044 00 $3,044.00
*+* Salmer 54NG (no bell engraving) '
6 Tenar Saxophone - Yamaha Model 475; with case 3 | $1,322.00 %2 644.00
Concert Snare Drum - Pearl Concert Series Snare; Matural]
7 Maple Shell; 14"x5.5"; SuperHoop Il huglps; tubelugsy - | crpi1455  $276.00 $552.00
Remo Renaissance headj
Concert Snare Drum Cases - Humeas & Berg Enduro Pr
8 . Case: 147x5.5" 2 DR4T4 £61.00 $122.00
Drum Stand - Pearl Model S1000L; Concert height snar
9 drum stand; double braced legs; Gyro-lock tilte 4 sl il
10 Crurn Throne - Pearl Model D2000; 4 leg tripo 1 $173.00 $173.00
1 Tuba Case - Case only to fit Mirafone Model 186U Tub 3 B1 ?231 03C $381.00 $1.143.00
12  Tuba Case - Case only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-321 Tubal 4 BBC32 $588.00 $588.00
13 Tuba Case - Case only to flt_*r'amaha Model YEB-102 Tub 4 BBC3D $588.00 $2 352.00
14 Electronic Metronome - Korg Model Doctor Beat DB-8 B $157.00 $942 .00
15 Electronic Tuner - Korg AT120 Electronic Tuner] € no bid
Stick/Mallet Case - Humes & Berg "Big Mac" mallet
16 accessory case; vulcanized fibre] 2 480 $70.00 $140.00
Timpani Heads - Remo timpani heads; 1 each - T2500 (237
17 Ext-Hazy), T2800 (26" Ext-Hazy), T3100 (28" Exi-Hazy)] 1 set $288.00 $288.00
T3400C (32" Ext-Hazy
18 Tambourine - Black Swamp Model T 1 no bid
Drum Heads - Evans drum heads; 1 each - B145T
19 S14H30; B10G2; B12G2; B14G2; TT10RGL: TT12RGLY 1 set $158.00 $158.00
TT14RGL: BD2ZEMAD; BD22RACW]
Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro; 1 each -
20 DR4515PBK, DRE14SPEK, DR47ESPEK, DR498SPBK | 1 set $417.00 $417.00
DR529SPBH]
Hardware Case - Humes & Berg Enduro Tilt and Pull
n Hardware case; 36" x 14.5" x 12.5", DR541ASPB i $236.00 ¥236.00
Timpani Covers - Ludwig Pro Padded Timpani Covers; 1 L223TP,26
22 each - 23" 26", 29", 32 1 set 29.32 $258.00 $258.00
Stick/Mallet Case - Vic Firth Stick/Accessory Case Model
23 CASE: 17" x 10.5" X 6 2 $66.00 $132.00
Cymbal Boom Stand - Pearl Model B1000; double braced '
24 unilock fite 4 $93.00 $372.00
Band Totals: I $20,983.00




RFB #5-002 Awarded Musical Instruments and supplies

Interstate Music
Item Item Description] Qty. g:lyi::; Pﬂ&:f‘:ﬂ " | Extended Price
Music Stands - Wenger Bravo, Desk Color - Raspberry; |
e ~ FrameFinish-Chromel 40 | "P9 | Taria
"2 | Music Stands - Wenger Classic 50; Blacd 40 | nobid |
pre Music Stand - Wenger Director's Stand; 3020 /2] | | .
__3___; ~transparent polycarbonate desk; Metal £t Y R ) iy
i Bassoon - Fox Model IV - Polypropylene body; Long bo
4 | with right hand whisper key lock] 2 30-70 | $3,309.00 $6,618.00
Tenor Saxophone - Selmer Model 54 Super Action80{ | [ : s
’ ks Sesmwthcasy | | 40 | $29000 PR
| “**+ Salmer 54NG (no bell engraving 5
ﬁ_—lr BRE Tgrﬂ-_s_gxnphnne Yam_@a_:_h‘!udaﬂ?_ﬁ__mth :ase] 2 045 | $128900 |  $2,578.00 |
| Concert Snare Drum - Pearl Concert Series Snare; Natural .
7 | Maple Shell; 14"x5.5", SuperHoop Il hoops, tube lugsy 5 no bid
Remo Renaissance headj
| Concert Snare Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro Pr : '""
8 Case; 14"x55] 2 | nobud ;
_ e | -
Drum Stand - Pearl Model S1000L; Concert height snare] [

9 drum stand; double braced legs; Gyro-lock tilter] : | 0-5_.0 961.00 ! ___52_410_0
40 | Drum Throne - Pearl Model D2000; 4 leg tri 1 0-30 | $117.00 ! $117.00
__”_'T"' Tuba Case - Case only to fit Mirafone Model 186U Tuba 3 ek i

5, 161 B T E 111 |l |

42 | Tuba Case - Case only to fit Y¥amaha Model YBB-321 Tub 1 0-30 $674.00 55?4 a0

| Tuba Case - Case only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-102 Tub | $460.0010 |

13 | S 030 | {\ocation | hmnu

| 74 | Electronic Metronome - Korg Model Doctor Beat DB-88] 6 | 0-30 | $127.00 $762.00

15 | Electronic Tuner - Korg AT120 Electronic Tuner} 6 no bid

| Stick/Mallet Case - Humes & Berg "Big Mac” mallet _
16 | accessory case; vulcanized fib no bid :
| Timpani Heads - Remo timpani heads; 1 each - T2500 (231 !
17 |  Ext-Hazy), T2800 (26" Ext-Hazy), T3100 (29" Ext-Hazy)| 1 set| no bid
i T3400C (32" Ext-Hazy
18 | Tambourine - Black Swamp Model T 1 no bid
| Drum Heads - Evans drum heads; 1 each - B145T]
19 | S14H30; B10G2; B12G2; B14G2, TT10RGL; TT12RGLY 1 set| no bid
i TT14RGL; BD22EMAD; BD22RACW
| Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro; 1 each -
20 | DR451SPBK, DR6145SPEBK, DR478SPEK, DR4985SPBK ] 1 set|| no bid
DR5295PBK|
Hardware Case - Humes & Berg Enduro Tilt and Pulll 1 S
2 Hardware case; 36" x 14.5" x 12.5"; DR541ASPBK]
f Timpani Covers - Ludwig Pro Padded Timpani Covers; 1 3
2 | each - 23", 26", 20, 377] | **t] nobe
| Stick/Mallet Case - Vic Firth Stick/Accessory Case Model| :
23 CASE: 17" x 10.5" x 61 2 no bid |
Cymbal Boom Stand - Pearl Model B1000; double braced i

- uniocktieg 4 | 000 | B

S A Band Totals: $16,035.00
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RFB #5-002 Awarded Musical Instruments and >upplies

Wenger Corporation
- Days to |Price per] Extended
Item Item Description:] Qty. Deli Unit Price
Music Stands - Wenger Bravo; Desk Color - Raspberry; ARO 30 .
___1___ : Frame Finish - Chrom 4’2 dl-!%%ﬂ_ 555_'__% 5_2'_3“ 00
9 " Music Stands - Wenger ger Classic 50; Blac 40 Am $39.00 ;1 560.00
''''' ] ~"Music Stand - Wenger Director's Stand; 3020 121 . | ARO30 | ¢y0c e
_3_ 1 _transparent polycarbonate desk; Metal ba 1 ~days | 5295_‘@__*_195_'@
" Bassoon - Fox Model IV - Polypropylene body; Long bored
4 | with right hand whisper key locky 2 No bid |
| .
e A TR AR L el e
' Tenor Saxophone - Selmer Model 54 Super Action 80 : _
& ks . Semsipwinossy ' ] MO [ DA 1
' ** Salmer 54NG (no bell engraving)j ! I
"6 | Tenor Saxophone - Yamaha Model 475 with casel 2 | Nobid | ) '''''''' >
t Concert Snare Drum - Pearl Concert Series Snare; Natura | ,
7 Maple Shell; 14"x5.5"; SuperHoop Il hoops; tube lugs] - Mok |
Remo Renaissance head '
A S | | 22
Concert Snare Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro Pr; o i
| Case; 14'x5.57 2 o i
9----.*"_ij'§t'énu Pearl Model S1000L; Concert height snare| No bid ! !
_____ _!_ drum stand; double braced legs; Gyro-lock titter]  ~ | ____0 | e
19 1 Drum Throne ___F’_l&l_a![l_h!g_clal D2000; 4 legtrlpnj 1 Nobid | .
1 ‘ “Tuba Case - Case only to fit Mirafone Model 186U Tub 3 No bid
'__.E—_:I:Liba Case - Case only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-321 Tuzj 1 No bid 2
13 | Tuba Case - Gase only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-102 Tu 4 No bid .
[ 14 Electronic Metronome - Korg Madel Doctor Beat DB-88] 6 Nobid | . x
15 Electronic Tuner - Korg AT120 Electronic Tunery 6 Mo bid ' |
Stick/Mallet Case - Humes & Berg "Big Mac® mallet & . I
16 accessory case; vulcanized fibre] 2 No bid I
. : | |
Timpani Heads - Remo timpani heads; 1 each - T2500 (237 ; '
17 Ext-Hazy), T2800 (26" Ext-Hazy), T3100 (29" Ext-Hazy){ 1 set Mo bid
i T3400C (32" Ext-Hazy 5 |
18 | Tambourine - Black Swamp Model TD4] 1 | Nobid |
Drum Heads - Evans drum heads; 1 each - B14ST; 5 .
19 S514H30; B10G2; B12G2; B14G2; TT10RGL; TT12RGL] 1 set Mo bid |
TT14RGL; BD22EMAD; BD22RACW]
i Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro; 1 each -
20 | DR451SPBK, DRE614SPBK, DR478SFPBK, DR4985FPEK Y 1 set Mo bid |
! DR529SPBK | |
21 Hardware Case - Humes & Berg Enduro Tilt and PuIJ 1 No bid [ '
Hardware case; 36" x 14.5" x 12.5"; DR541ASPBK '
Timpani Covers - Ludwig Pro Padded Timpani Covers; 1 .
= each - 23", 26", 297,32 ' 5¢t] Nebi
| Stick/Mallet Case - Vic Firth Stick/Accessory Case Modelf :
tt CASE; 17" x105'x6] 2 | MNebd |
| Cymbal Boom Stand - Pearl Model B1000; double braced) §
% 5 unilock tited 4 | NoPd 1
Band Tutals:‘ 1| §4,215.00
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RFB #5-00Z Awarded MusiCal Instruments and SUupplies

String & Horn Shop
' Days to | Price per Extended
Item Item De:acriptlun. Qty. Delivery Unit Price
Music Stands - Wenger Bravo; Desk Color - Raspberry, :
Ty ¢ oy o8 Frame Finish - Chrome| 40 | 1 Pid ade
2 Music Stands - Wenger Classic 50, Black] 4g no bid i
3 Sk “Music Stand - Wenger Director's Stand; 30"x20 1/2 .nn bid _T_
Gt transparent polycarbenate desk; Metal base | “had
Bassoon - Fax Model IV - Polypropylene body; Long bor
R with right hand whisper key lo 2 no bid
| Tenor Saxophone - Selmer Model 54 Super Action 8 | 's2,900.00 |
a3 Rk i  Seriesliwihcesd ' f 90 waengmwns,_.__s?'_gi'c_'_g_
. Selmer 54NG (no bell engraving 14-30 $2:fgitﬂﬂ $2.699.00
E_—_ i H _____Ianur ga_:f_qphnne Yamaha Mud§14_i'5 with cas 2 __rib:b_id_ a0 g
| Concert Snare Drum - Pearl Concert Series Snare; Na!urs?
7 Maple Shell; 14"x5.5", SuperHoop Il hoops; tube lugs] - 14-30 $399.00 | $798.00
Remo Renaissance headg |
"~ Concert Snare Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro - | : !
8 Case; 14557 2 no bid
Drum Stand - Pearl Model S1000L; Concert height snare _ T
9 4 ~ drum stand; double braced legs; Gyro-lock tilter 4 T1 0 1 $104.00 | 3;41_'5_'_0?_
10 | Drum Throne - Pearl Model D2000; 4 leg tripod] 1 7-10 | $199.00 | §$199.00 |
11 Tuba Case - Case only to fit Mirafone Model 186U Tub 3 7414 | $309.00 | $927.00
42 | Tuba Case - Case only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-321 Tuj 1 7-14 $299.00 il $299.00
13 | Tuba Case - Case only to fit Yamaha Model YBB-102 Tul 4 7.14 $289.00 | $1,156.00
14 | Electronic Metronome - Korg Model Doctor Beat DB-88] 6 | 7-14 | $166.00 |  $0.00
15 | Electronic Tuner - Korg AT120 Electronic Tuner] 6 no bid |
Stick/Mallet Case - Humes & Berg "Big Mac™ mallet ;
16 : accessory case; vulcanized fibre] 2 no bid
i
| Timpani Heads - Remo timpani heads; 1 each - T2500 (231
17 Ext-Hazy), T2800 (26" Ext-Hazy), T3100 (29" Ext-Hazy)} 1 set|  4-7 $203.80 $203.80
T3400C (32" Ext-Hazy
18 | Tambourine - Black Swamp Model TD4| 1 7-14 $117.00 | $117.00
i Drum Heads - Evans drum heads; 1 each - B145T] |
18 | S14H30: B10G2; B12G2; B14G2; TT10RGL; TT12RGL}] 1 set 5-10 $132.40 I $132.40
TT14RGL; BD22EMAD; BD22RACVY
! Drum Cases - Humes & Berg Enduro; 1 each -
20 DR451SPBK, DRE14SPEK, DR4785PBK, DR498SPBK] 1 set| no bid
DR5295PBK]
' Hardware Case - Humes & Berg Enduro Tilt and Pul 4 bid
w1 Hardware case; 36" x 14.5" x 12.5"; DR541ASPB dsi |
| Timpani Covers - Ludwig Pro Padded Timpani Covers; 1 .
22 ! aach - 23 26" 29" 329 1¢t| 7-10 $419.00 | $419.00
| Stick/Mallet Case - Vic Firth Stick/Accessory Case Modell ;
23 | CASE: 17" x 10.5" x 61 2 710 $73.00 . $146.00
Cymbal Boom Stand - Pearl Model B1000; double braced; |
24 unilock tiltgr : 4 7-14 $99.EIE_II g $0.00
R Band Totals: [ s7.722.29
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RFB #5-002 Awarded Musical Instruments and Supplies

Holze Music Co.

Lisle Violin Shop

Itern Description:

Extended
Price

Descript. Days to | Price Per

ript Days to | Price Per

Price

Calle (4/4 size) instrumant must
fully cansed, using traddiona
methods of construction;  quali
spruce top; back, neck & ribs
maple. Should have a hand L
synihetic  vamish.  Lamina
construction is not acceplabla. Inlai
purfling & bridga handftted, not sel
adjusting; fittings, fingar-board,
of highest quality ebony fitted
wiltner lailpiece and mylon fa
adjuster, 4 ftuners and (jagar
orchestra sirings. End pin needs |
be a USLA endpin amnd the
neads to be a Glasser graphite bow,
Instrument must be shop adjusted
professional standards and nclud
@ mooradian cover.

25 1

Calle (4/4 siza). instrument must
Tully carsed, wsing iradibona
methods of construction; quali
spruce top. back, neck & ribs o
maple, Should have a hand appliad)
ol or spirit wvamish. Laminated|
canstruction s not acceptable. Inlaid)
purfing & bridge handfitted, not sel
adjusting; fittings, finger-board, peg
of highest quality ebony fitted wi
wittmer  lailpiece  and  mylan 1
|adjuster, 4 tuners and {jagar
orcheslra strings. End pin needs
|be @ USLA endpin and the
\needs to e a Glasser graphite bow.
[Instrument must be shop adjusted
|profesaional standards and Includ
!a mooradian cover.

|Atermates: Scher & Roth or Glaesel
|with same above specifications

|Altemates: Scherl & Roth or Glaesel

. with same above specifications

Piano, Yamaha P22 Studio  with

28 ¢

a0
a1

Dially for piano, 004

Cowver for piano, GPC38
Orchestra Total:)

Delivery |  Unit

60-80

Ruoth

RCo7CE4H | 9090

§2.190.98 | $2,199.99

§3,700.00  $3,700.00

$135.00 $135.00
| #140.00 $140.00

§1,799.99 | $1,799.99 |graphite Bow|

Delivery Unit

7-30 $965.06

nc

Ag spacified -
Graphile
Bow inc.

T-30 §1,32600  $1,326.00

Mo bid
Mo bid

I $2,291.06|

Discount far other tems, purchased on
Exception to discount:

| $7,974.98
O-40% ; |
[Hscount |
depends on
the itern

Awarded Orchestra Total:
Awarded Band Total:
Awarded Orchestra and Band Totals:|

niet 20/110% Explantion kige Violin Shop provides a
"schonl products and services catalog”. Prices are net
{substantial descount for outfit pricing) or marked with
# for additional 20% discount. Discounts total 15% to

60 mast discounts are 40-50% below MSRP (if
suggested by manufacturer)




RFB #5-002 Awarded Musical Instruments and Supplies

String&Homs-h

Days to | Price Per | Extended

Item | Qity Item Dascription: Descript, Deiivery| _ unit Sria

| |Cello (44 size): Instrurment nvist be
|fully carved, using traditiona
[ |methods of construction;  quali
| spruce top; back, neck & ribs

purfling & bridge handfitted, not
25 1 adjusting; fittings, finger-ooard,

of highest quality ebony fitted wi
witiner failpiece and mylon tai
adjusier, 4 tuners and (jagar
orchesira strings. End pin nesds to
ba a USLA endpin and the bow]
nesds 1o be a Glasser graphite bow
Imstrument must be shop adjusted Lo |
professional standards and include) |
| mooradian cover.

School Il 444 | 14-30 | $84800 | $048,00

ICE"I:I (44 size): instrument must
|fully carved, wusing traditional
imethods  of construchon,  quali

Qll or spinl varnish.  Laminated
construection is not acceptable. Inlald
purfling & beidge handfited, not sel
adjusting. fitings, finger-boand,
of highest quality ebony fitted w
wittner tailpeece and mylon tail
aduster, 4 ftumers and (jagar)
| orchestra strings. End pin needs 1o
| ba a USLA endpin and the bow
needs o be a Glasser graphile bow,
Instrument must be shop adjusied o
professional standards and indude]
a modradian coves

Gliga Gems Il

414 ol 14-30 | §51,185.00| 51,185.00

Scher & Roth |
7 | Allermates: Scherd & Roth or Glaesal E230H3 |
| |with same above specifications | Laminated 34 |
| | Base

14-30 | $1,629.00| $1.629.00

|
' i .

| Scherl & Roth | |

| Alternates: Sched & Roth or Glasssl |
- with same above specifications RBECOE3 344 | 14-30 | §1.899.00) $1,899.00

Fiano, Yamaha P22 Studic with| |
- bench No bid

30 Dolly for plano, J4009 No bad

Y Caover for piano, GPC38 Mo bid
Orchestra Total | | $5,672.00|

Digcount for other items, purchased on
Exception to discount] 0 min 0%

order, 15 % on |

rmusic,, up to

40% discount |

Awarded Orchestra Total: $9,794.06
Awarded Band Total: $22,428.20
Awarded Orchestra and Band Totals:| $32,222.26




