

College Station Independent School District
Library Banks RFP #11-010

Vendor	Excess and Associates	Enduser Publishing	Heaven Crest Publishing	Princeton Publishing	Houghton Mifflin Harcourt	The Gale Group, Inc.	Blackwell Book Company	Lexipress Publications, Inc.	ProQuest	Health	Northwest Tech, Inc.	Arvest Enterprises, Inc.	Miller & Typner	Barrett & Hobbs Book Industry	Carroll Stream	
General Trade Book, regular, trade, adult and young adult 1. Amazon.com from Amazon.com (ISBN, ISBN-10)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	0%	23%	20%	0%	5-13%	2%	5-11%	21%	20-25%	No bid	
Discount from Publisher's list	0-30%	25% off list price	25% off list price	0-10% off list	No bid	0%	21%	20%	0%	5-13%	2%	0-27%	21%	20-25%	2%	
2. Books, Publishers Library (School/Institutional)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No bid	N/A	22%	20%	0%	5-13%	2%	0-17%	No bid	20-25%	2%	
Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	No bid	N/A	22%	20%	0%	5-13%	2%	0-17%	No bid	20-25%	No bid	
3. Books, The Internet - Publishers	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	No response	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	No response	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
4. Books, Amazon	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	No response	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
5. Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
6. Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
7. Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
8. Discount from Publisher's list	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
9. Subscription - MANGO	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%	Contact sales rep for discounts on discounts and pricing for electronic databases and dependent term	N/A	No response	0%	5-13%	0%	0-2%	20%	20-25%	No bid	
1. [Publisher/Supplier name and description]																
Name:	Greg Escue	Greg Escue	Greg Escue	Greg Escue	Jeff Zeleny	Hilda Williamson	Michael Sherman	John Wayne	Greg Escue	Juan Herrera	Gayle and Ed Harms	Sandy Jones	Karl Dumblyton	Abel De Los Santos	Esos and Associates	
Address:	3711 Teal Street Brookshire, TX 77433	370 Reed Rd. #207 Brookshire, TX 77433	3711 Teal Street Brookshire, TX 77433	3000 Golf Rd. Ste 208 Rolling Meadows, IL 60008	2700 Drake Road Farmington Hills, Michigan 48331	500 E. IL RT 22 Lake Zurich, IL 60047	321 Century Plaza Dr. Ste 100 Houston, TX 77023	21401 Promontory Cir. San Antonio, TX 78256	PO Box 3543 Oak Brook, IL 60172-3543	PO Box 3538 Jackson, TN 38301-3538	281-153-8999	630-962-3722	281-153-8999	711 Teal Ave. College Station, TX 77845	3311 Teal Street Brookshire, TX 77433	Esos and Associates
Phone:	800-676-7093	800-676-2093	800-676-2093	800-676-2093	800-877-4153	800-877-4153	812-877-8381	281-333-8900	800-765-5485	800-413-3983	800-413-3983	800-765-8935	800-765-8935	800-765-8935	800-676-7093	
2. Complete catalog and pricing	1.30	1.30	1.30	1.30	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25	
3. Can you provide hosting services?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	
4. Can MANGO record data into the vendor's?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	
5. Do you provide hosting services?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	
Yes, provide description of services (cost, warranty, rental/download/usage as to bandwidth services)	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	
Is the hosting fee annual or monthly?	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	Annual	
Cost of the book?	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	Per title	
Resident Certification	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	Resident	
Payment Certification	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	Payment	
Includes these publishers: ABC-CLIO, Arden, Baker & Taylor, BarnesandNoble.com, Blackwell, Brill, Cambridge University Press, Cengage, Corwin, Elsevier, Emerald, Envision, Gale, Greenwood, Harcourt, Heinemann, Holt, Jones & Bartlett, Kendall/Hunt, Marshall Cavendish, McGraw-Hill, MANGO, Pearson, Prentice Hall, Sage, Scholastic, Thomson, University of Michigan Press, West, Wiley, Wolters Kluwer, Zanichelli	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	

Vendor	Vendor Name	Vendor Address	Vendor Phone	Vendor Fax	Vendor E-mail	Vendor Website	Vendor Description	Vendor Services	Vendor Products	Vendor Pricing	Vendor Terms	Vendor Conditions	Vendor Notes
1.	Academy of Art University	1000 University Ave	916-441-1000	916-441-1001	academy@art.edu	www.art.edu	Academy of Art University, San Francisco, CA	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies
2.	Academy of Art University	1000 University Ave	916-441-1000	916-441-1001	academy@art.edu	www.art.edu	Academy of Art University, San Francisco, CA	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies
3.	Academy of Art University	1000 University Ave	916-441-1000	916-441-1001	academy@art.edu	www.art.edu	Academy of Art University, San Francisco, CA	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies
4.	Academy of Art University	1000 University Ave	916-441-1000	916-441-1001	academy@art.edu	www.art.edu	Academy of Art University, San Francisco, CA	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies
5.	Academy of Art University	1000 University Ave	916-441-1000	916-441-1001	academy@art.edu	www.art.edu	Academy of Art University, San Francisco, CA	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies	Books, Journals, Art Supplies

