RFB # 7-015 Musical Instruments

Taylor Music, Inc, Interstate Music Nick Rail Music Shar Products Company K and S Music
. Days to | Price per | Extended |} Daysto | Price per | Extended | Days to | Price per | Extended | Daysto | Price par | Extended | Daysto | Price per | Extended
Item| Qty Band Item Descriptions: Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Prive Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unli: Price Del¥very Llnil: Price
T | 3 Yamaha Marching Mellophane YMP-204MS vith MPC-203 Case| ] |
T Alternate;|
i Yamaha Marching Baritone convertible 3 valva in brass(over the’
2 3 shoulder style) »
Alternata;
3 4 Peterson 12 Window Strobe Center tuner, or 12 window substituts [ i i
Alternate: T
Fox Renard Bassoon 240 Artist Model « Red Maple Body with French
4 1 metal ring and German System Keywork] 180 days | $6,299.00 %6,299.00
Afternate:
[ Tubas—valve rotary uprlght-]  10days | $5333.00]  $21,332.00 | i - | E :
- Alternate: Mrlaphone 5186, w/case
R McAdams Metronomes] 30 days | $511.00;  $2,555,00 | i - ] E T 1 ]
Alternate; - B
7 1 Digimet remote controlled matronome o ] | | 18-30 |  4575.00! $575,00 \ ]
Alternate:
B 1 Contrabassoon--Amati, ar simllar quality i | 0-30 | $5,057.00] 45,057.00 | 1 | |
Alternate;
9 2 Barltone Saxophones—Unison or similar brand { | | } i o _5-7days | %1,719.00| $3,438.00
Altarnate: RS Berkeley SCBSE0
10 4 Yamaha YEP 321 4 valve baritones (silver plated) | i ! | i | 30days | $749.00| $2,996.00
Alternate! RS Berkeley SCBR10
11 1 Cne Adams Miramba with Endro frame 4.3 octave} 15days | $3,188.00; +3,188,00 | ] i | | |
' Alternate: #MCKF-43 )
12 |2 Miraphane Tubas Advanced models ! i | ] f | | |
Alternate;
1316 Yamaha three valve baritones] ! L { ] | | 730 days | $695.00] $4,170.00
Altarnate: RS Berkeley SCBRO8
141773 Oboes (Lovea, or simliar) i | ! | ] | | ]
) Alternate e i
15 2 Fox (resin} with law B fiat i P ! | ! I \ |
R Alternate: )
61 B flat Contra Bass Clarinet~wood preferred ] ! i | | | | |
Alternate:;
17 11 Besson Euphonuim--4 valve upright compensation model in brass i 5 ! l ! | ‘ |
Alternate: )
18 1 Yamaha Marimba, or siméilar—intermediate to advanced level| : ] ] | | ; e 1 |
Alternate: ~ :
19771 Adams vibes with endro frame|] 15 days | $3,268,00] " $3,266.00 | i 1 g 1
3 Alternate; #CVIF _
20 2 Jarvls Marimba Frames, or similar (low A frames) I $444.00| $B88.00 | i i I § {- | |
. Alternate: B
21 1 LP Giovanni Banges i | | | 1 i
o ] Alternate; )
22 | 4 Tubas 3/4 size three or four valve upright-Klng or similar model | ; | | i 5 30-60 days $1,295,00] 45,180.60
Alternate 4y N RS Berkeley SCTO42
23 11 Base FlutefAdvanced level ! | | | [ ' | E
Alternate: .
B E R 12 Channel Mixer] § i | { | | : I
\ ] Alternate: . .
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Total:

| $37,528,00

| %5,057,00

£575.00

$15,784.00

MNotes:

Delivery time |s based on best astimatesl
glven thls day from the manufacturers
|nd subject totally on thelr abillty to
dellver when po's are written, 1t s to
henoted that orders placed from June 1
to Aug 1 will take additional time to flll,
pleasa try to avold this time perled H]
qulcker dellvery Is needed,

Item

Qty
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Extended
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Days to
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Unit

Extended
Price
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Extended
Price
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Delivery
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Unit

Extended
Price

Days to
Delivery

Price Per
Unit

Extended
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25

Cello (4/4 size): Instrument must be fully carved, using traditicnal
metheds of constructlon; quallty spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand epplied synthetic varnish, Laminated construction Is
not acceptable. Inlaid purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quallty ebony fitted with wittner
tailplece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (fagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser]
graphite bow. Instrument must be shop adjusted to professional]
standards and Include a mooradian cover.

Na bid

£0.00

10 days

$767.00

$767.00

no bld

Madel; Lisle Medel 30

Alternates: Scheri & Roth or Glaese! with same above specifications

26

Cello (3/4 slze): instrument musé be fully carved, using traditional]
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple,
Should have a hand applied synthetic varnlsh. Laminated canstruction is
not acceptable, Inlald purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner]
tallplece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser]
graphlte bow. Instrument must be shop adjusted ta professional
standards and include a mooradian cover.

No bid

$0.00

10 days

$767.00

_$767.00

Model: Lisle Model 30

Alternates: Scher| & Roth or Glaase| with same above specifications

27

Cello {1/2 size): Instrument must be fully carved, uslng traditional
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple,
Shaould have a hand applled synthetic varnish. Laminated construction is]
net acceptable, Inlald puriling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner,
tallpiece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and {jagar) orchestra strings,
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser
graphite bow, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professional
standards and Include a mooradian cover,

No bid

$0.00

10 days

$767.00

$767.00

Madel: Lisle Mode} 30

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaeset with same above specifications
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28

Celio (4/4 size): Instrument must be fully carved, using traditional|
methods of constructfon; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applied ol or spirit varnish, Laminated construction
Is not acceptable, Inlald purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner
tallplece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs o be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser
graphite bow, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professlonal
standards and Include a mooradian cover,

No bid

$0.00

10 days

%1,089.00

$1,089.00

Maodel: Lisle Model 312

Alternates; Scherl & Roth or Glaesel with same ahove specifications

29

Cello {12 size): instrument must be fully carved, using tradltlonalr
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applled synthetic varnish, Laminated construction Is
nat acceptable. Inlaid purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quallty ebony fitted with wittner,
tallplece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (Jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser
graphlte bow, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professlonalf
standards and include a mooradlan caver,

No bid

$0.00

10 days

41,089,00

$1,089.00

Maodel: Lisle Model 312

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaesel with same above specifications

30

Cello (3/4 slze): Instrument must be fully carved, wsing traditional]
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applied synthetlc varnish. Laminated canstruction Ig
not acceptable. Inlald purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner]
talipiece and mylen tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (Jagar} orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpln and the bow needs to be a Glasser]
graphite bow. Instrument must be shop adjusted te professiona)
standards and include a mooradian cover.

No bid

40,00

10 days

$1,089.00

$1,085,00

Maodel; Lisle Model 312

Alternates: Schert & Roth or Glaesel with same above specifications

31

Bass (3/4 size) Figure lamlnated construction; handfitted top pgrade
german maple adjustable bridge (regular symphony cut, not rabbath).
Fittings, fingerboard, tallplece, & ondpin socket must ba highest quality
ehony. Brass tailplaca adjuster, tyrolean-style machine head; professlonal
strings (splrocore orchestra). Bow needs to be a French Glasser Graphile
bow with horsehair. Instrurment must be shop adjusted to professional}
standards and Include a mooradlan cover.

No hid

_£0.00

Ne bid

Model: Lisle Christopher Concert
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Aiternates; Schert & Roth or Glaesel with sama above spacificatlons

32

Bass (3/4 size): Bedy laminated construction with a carved spruce top;
handfitted top grade gerrnan maple adjustabla bridge (regular symphony
cut, not rabbath). Fittings, fingerboard, tallplace, & endpin socket must be
highest quality ebony. Brass tallpieca adjuster, tyrolean-style machine
head; prafasslenal strings (splrocore orchestra). Bow needs to be a Franch
Glasser Graphite bow with horsehalr. Instrumant must be shop adjusted
to prefessional standards and include a mooeradian cover,

No bid

£0.00

Na bid

Model: Lisle Christopher Prafesslonal bModal 1

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glassel with same above specifications

33

Bass (1/2 slze): Figure laminated construction; handfitted top grade
german maple adjustable bridge (regular sympheny cut, not rabbath).
Fittings, fingerboard, tallplece, & endpin socket must be highest guality,
ebony. Brass tallpiece ad|uster, tyrolean-style machine head; profesalonal
strlngs (spirocora orchestra). Bow neads o be a French Glasser Graphlte
bow with horsehair. Instrumani must be shop adjusted to professional
standards and Includa a mooradian cover.

Na bld

$0.00

10 days

51,113.00

$1,113.00

Maodel: Lisla Christapher Acadamy

Alternates: Schert| & Roth or Glaese| with same above specificatlons

34

Bass (1/2 size): Body laminated construction with a carvad spruce top;
handfitted top grada garman maple ad|ustable bridge (regular symphony
cut, not rabhath). Filtings, fingerboard, tailplece, & andpin socket must be
highest quality ebony. Brass tallplece adjustar, tyrolean-styla machine
head; professlonal strings (splrocare erchastra). Bow needs to be a French
Glasser Graphite bow with harsehalr. Instrumant must be shop adjusted
to professional standards and Include a meoradlan cover,

No bid

$0,00

No bid

$0.00

Madal; LIsle Christopher Professional Madel 1

Alternates: Scharl & Roth or Glaesal with same above specifications

35

Bass (1/4 size)! Figure laminated construction; handfitted top grade]
german maple adjustable bridge (regutar symphony cut, not rabbatih).
Flttings, fingerboard, tallpiece, & endpin socket must be highest quallty
obony, Brass tallplece ad)ustar, tyrolean-style machina head; profossional
strings {spirocore orchestra). Bow needs to be a French Glasser Graphits
bow with horsehalr, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professional]
standards and Include a mooradian covet,

No bid

$0.00

10 days

§1,113.00

$1,113.00

iModel: Lisle Christopher Acadamy

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Giaasel with same above specifications




Ta

ylor Music, Inc.

Interstate Music

Nick Rail Music

Shar Products Company

K and S Music

Daysto | Price per | Extended | Daysto | Price per | Extended | Daysto | Price per | Extended | Daysto | Price per | Extended | Daysto | pri Extended
Band H Yy rice per ende
Item | Qty Item Descriptions Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price
Bass (1/4 slze): Body laminated construction with a carved spruce top;
handfitted top grade garman maple adustable bridge (regular symphony
cut, not rabbath), Fittings, fingerboard, tailplece, & endpin socket must he
35 1 |highast quality ebony. Brass tailplece adjuster, tyrolean-style machine
head; profassional strings {spirocare orchastra), Bow nests to be a French
Glasser Graphite bow with horsehair, Instrument must ba shop adjusted
to professional standards and include a mooradian caver,
o No bid %0.00 Na hid No bid
Model: Lisle Christoepher Profassional Model 1
Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaese! with same above specliications
37 1 {Plano, Yamaha P22 Studio with bench No bld _
38 1 _{Dolly for Plano 14009 No bld
39 Cover for Plano GFC38 No bld No bld No bid
Orchestra Tatal: £0,00] Nobid Mo bid $7,794.00
Days ta Days to Days to Days to Days to
Item | Oty . Choir Item Descriptions: Delivery | Per Unit | Extended | Delivery | Per Unit | Extended | Delivery | per Unit | Extended | Delivery | per Unit | Extended } Dellvery | perunit | Extended
40 1 Piano, &' Ebony Grand Plane, Yamaha, Boston or Stelnway, padded cover
for bench Mo bld 40,00
41 2 Piano, Upright Plano - ebony finish, Yamaha, Boston, or Steinway No bld $0.00 No bid No bid
Choir Total; $0.00{ No bid No bid
Subtotal Pricing
Suhtotal Band (1-24} $37,528.00 %5,057.00 $575.00 No bid $24,435.80
Subtotal ( Orchestra 25-39) No bid No bid No bld $7,734.00 No bid
Subtotal Choir {40-41) Na bid No bid Mo bid Ne bid No bid
Total: $37,528,00 %5,057.00 $575.00 $7,794.00 %$24,435.80




National Educational Music

Peripole-Bergerauit, Inc

Washington Music

\ Daysto | Price per | Extended | Dayste |Price per| Extended | Dayste | Price per | Extended
Ttem | Qty Band Item Descriptions: Dellvery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price
1 3 Yamaha Marching Mellophone YMP-204MS with MPC-203 Case 30-75 $969.00 $2,907.00
T ey I a -
Yamaha Marching Baritone convertible 3 valve in brass(over the
2 3 shaulder style)l ~ 30-75 $1,259.00;  $3,777.00
Alternate: YBH3.01M
3 4 Peterson 12 Window Strobe Center tuner, or 12 window substitute 10-20 | $3,129.00] $12,516.,00 }
Alternate:
Fox Renard Bassoon 240 Artist Model - Red Maple Bedy with French
4 1 metal ring and German System Keywork
Alternate; o
5 4 Tubas--valve rotary upright- i | ! i
Alternate: T
5 [ McAdams Metronemes! | | ] o
Alternats:
7 1 Diglmet remote controlled metronome} | |
e Alternate: )
8 1 Contrabassoon--Amatl, or simllar quallty | |
Alternate: .
g 2 Baritone Saxophones---tnison or similar brand | | i I
Alternate;
10 4 Yamaha YEP 321 4 valve baritones (sllver plated) | i ) | |
Alternate:
1 1 1 Cne Adams Miramba with Endro frame 4.3 octave] | i I
B Alternate:] T
12 2 Miraphone Tubas Advanced madels| | i | 5,495,000  %10,990,00
Alternata; 1864V
1371 6 Yamaha three valve baritones [ i | i o
Alternate:
4173 Oboes {Loree, or simitar) ! ! | $5,450,000  £10,900.00
Alternate;
15 3 Fox (resin) with low Bflal 3060 | $1,955.00]  $3,916.00 | ;
Alternata; #333 )
16 1 A flat Contra Bass Clarlnet—weod preferred [ i | $14,565.00]  $14,565,00
Alternate: Selmer 41
17 1 Besson Euphonuim--4 valve uprlght compensation model In brass 30-60 | 4$3,559.000  43,559.00 B [ i
Alternate: Yamaha YEPG42
8] 1 Yamaha Marimba, ar similar—intermediate to advanced levell  30-78 | $3,347.00]  %23,14710 | i
Alternate;] YM31430 .
It Adams vlbes with endro frame | | ] | B
) Alternate;
20 2 Jarvis Marimba Frames, or similar {low A frames) i i ) I |
Alternate;
201 LP Glavannl Bangos{ ; g 15-30 $12095]  &120.98] g ]
Alternate:]
2 | 4 Tubas 3/4 size three or four valve wpright—King or similar model i l __ T T -
Alternata:]
23 1 Base FlutefAdvanced level; See attached f l $1,549.00 E g
Alternata! 5 cholces shown on bid
244 1 12 Channel Mixer | |
_ Alternate;




National Educational Music

Peripole-Bergerault, Inc

Washington Music

Item

Qty

Band Item Descriptions:

Days to
Delivery

Price per
Unit

Extended
Price

Days to
Delivery

Price per
Unit

Extended
Price

Days to
Delivery

Price per
Unit

Extended
Prite

. ot

530,373.00

$120.95

£36,455.00

Notes:

Item

Qty

Orchestra Item Descriptions:

Days to
Delivery

Price Per
Unit

Extended
Price

Days to
Delivery

Price Per
Unit

Extended
Prica

Days to
Delivery

Price Per
Unit

Extended
Price

25

Cello {4/4 size): nstrument must be fully carved, uelng traditional
methods of canstruction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple,
Should have g hand applled synthetic varnlsh, Laminated construction is
not acceptable, Infald purfiing & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner]
tallplece and mylon tail adjuster, 4 tuners and (Jagar) orchestra strings.
End piri needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser|
graphite bow. Instrument must be shop adjusted to professional
standards and Include a mooradlan cover,

Modal: Lisle Model 30

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaese| with same above specifications

26

Cello (3/4 size}: Instrument must be fully carved, using traditional]
methods of constructfon; quality spruce top; back, neclt & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applled synthetic varnlsh, Laminated canstructlon s
not acceptable, Infald purfling & bridge hancdfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner]
tallplece and myton tail adjuster, 4 tuners and (Jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glassen
graphite bow. Instrument must be shop adjusted to professlonal
standards and Include a meoradian cover.

_iModel: Lisle Model 30

Alternates; Scher] & Rath or Glaesel with same abave specifications

27

Cello (12 slze): Instrument must be fully carved, using traditlonal
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple,
Should have a hand applied synthetic varnish. Laminated construction is
not acceptable, Inlaid purfling & bridge handfitted, net self adiusting;
fittings, finger-beard, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittrer
tailplece and mylon tall adjustar, 4 tuners and (jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpln and the bow needs to be a Glasser|
graphite bow, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professionall
standards and include a mooradlan cover.

Madel; Lisle Model 30

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaesel with same above specifications




National Educatienal Music

Peripaole-Bergerault, Inc

Washington Music

Item

Qty
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28

Cello (4/4 size): instrument must be fully carved, using traditlonal]
methads of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applled oil or spirit varnish, Laminated construction
Is not acceptable. Infald purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner]
tailplece and mylon tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (jagar) archestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser,
graphlte bow, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professional|
standards and inciude a mooradlan cover,

Medel: Lisle Mode| 312

Alternates; Scher| & Roth ar Glazsel with same above specifications

29

Cello {12 size): Instrument must be fully carved, using traditlonal
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple.
Should have a hand applied synthetic varnish, Laminated construction s
nat acceptable. Inlald purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quality ebony fitted with wittner
tallplece and myton tall adjuster, 4 tuners and (jagar) orchestra strings.
End pin needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser
graphite baw, Instrument must be shop adjusted to professlonal
standards and include a mooradian cover.

Madel: Lisle Model 312

Alternates: Scher| & Roth or Glaesel with same above specifications

30

Cello (3/4 slze): instrument must be fully cerved, using traditionalf
methods of construction; quality spruce top; back, neck & ribs of maple,
Should have 3 hand applied synthetic varnish, Laminated construction Is
not acceptable. Inlaid purfling & bridge handfitted, not self adjusting;
fittings, finger-board, pegs of highest quallty ebony fitted with wittner|
tailptece and mylen tail adjuster, 4 tuners and {jagar) orchestra strings,
End pln needs to be a USLA endpin and the bow needs to be a Glasser,
graphite bow. Instrurnent must be shop adjusted to professional
standards and Include @ mooradian cover.

Model; Lisle Model 312

Alternates: Scherd & Roth or Glaesel with same above specifications

Kl

Bass (3/4 slza): Figure laminated construction; handfitted top grade)
garman maple adjustable bridge (regular sympheny eut, not rabbath),
Fittings, fingerboard, tailplece, & endpln sockat must be highest quality
ehony. Brass tailplece aduster, tyrolean-style machine head; professlonal
strings (spirocore orchestra). Bow needs {o be a French Glasser Graphite
bow with horsehalr, Instrumeant must be shop adjusted to professional
standards and Include a mooradian cover,

§1,789.00

$1,759,00

Model: Lisle Christopher Cancert




National Educational Music

Peripnle-BeggerauIt,_inc

Washington Music

Item

Qty

Band Jtem Descriptions:

Days to
Delivery

Price per
Unit

Extended
Price

Days to
Delivery

Price per
Unit

Extended
Price

Days to | Price per | Extended
Delivery Unit Price

Alternates; Scherl & Rath or Glaese! with same above specifications

Chrlstopher Concert

32

Bass (3/4 size): Body faminated constructlon with a carved spruce top;
handfitted top grade german maple adjustable bridge (regular symphany
cut, not rabbath). Fittings, fingarboard, tailplece, & endpln socket must be
highest quality ebony. Brass tallplece adjuster, tyrolean-styls machine
head; professlonal strings (spirocore archestra). Bow needs to be a French
Glassar Graphite bow with horsehalr. Instrument must be shop adjusted
to prefessional standards and include a mooradian caver,

$2,295.00 $2,295.00

Madel: Lisle Christopher Professional Maodel 1

Alternates: Scharl & Roth or Glaesa| with same above spacifications

Christopher Professlonal Model 1
)

33

Bass (1/2 size): Figure laminatad constructlon; handfittad top grade
germen mapie adjustable brldge (regular symphony cut, net rabbath}.
Elttings, fingerboatd, tallplecs, & endpin socket must be highest quall
abony, Brass tallploce adjuster, tyrolean-style maching head; professiona)
strings {spiracore orchestra). Bow needs to be a French Glasser Graphite
bow with hersehalr. Instrument must be shop adjusied to professional
standards and include a mooradlan cover.

Model: Lisle Christopher Academy

Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaasel with same above spacifications

34

Bass {1/2 siza); Body laminated construction with a carved spruce top,
handfitted top grade garman maple adustable bridge (regular symphany
cut, not rabbath). Fittings, fingerboard, taliplece, & endpin socket must be
highest quality ebony. Brass tallpiece adjuster, tyrolean-style machine
head; professional sttings {spiracare archastra). Bow nesds to be a French
Glasser Graphlte bow with horsehalr. Instrument must be shop adjusted
to professional standards and include a mooradian cover,

$2,285.00 %2 295,00

Madel: Lisle Christopher Professional Modal 1

Alternstes: Scher] & Roth or Glaesel with same above spacifications

Christopher Professional Model 1

35

Bass (t/4 slze); Figure laminated construction; handfitted top grade
german maple adjustable bridge (regular symphony cut, nat rabbath),
Fittings, fingerboard, tallplece, & endpln socket must be highest quality
ebony. Brass taliplece adjuster, tyrolean-style machine head; professional
strings {splrocore orchestra). Bow nieeds to be a French Glasser Graphite
bow with horsehair. Instrument must be shop adjusted to professianal
standards and Include a mooradian cover.

Modal: Lisla Christopher Academy

Altarnates: Scharl & Roth or Glaese] with same above specifications

Christopher Acedemy
i |




National Educational Music | Peripole-Bergerault, Inc Washington Music
A Dayste | Price per | Extended | Daysto |Price per] Extended | Dayate | Price per | Extended
Item| Qty Band Item Descriptions: Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price Delivery Unit Price
Bass (174 slze)! Bady faminatad caopstitiction with™a carved spfuce fop,
handfitted top grade german maple adjustable bridge (regutar symphony
cut, not rabbath). Fittings, fingerbeard, tailpiece, & endpln socket must be|
36 1 Ihighest guality ebony. Brass taliplece adjuster, tyrofean-style machine
head; profassional strings (spirocore orchestra), Bow nesds to be a Franch
Glasser Graphite bow with horsehalr. instrument must be shop adjusted
to professional standards and Include a maooradian cover.
§2,285,00 $2,295.00
Model: Lisle Christopher Prefassional Madel 1
Alternates: Scherl & Roth or Glaesel with same above spaclfications Christophar Professional Model 1
37 | 1 |Piano, Yamaha P22 Studio with bench ) .
38 1 |Dolly for Piano J4009
39 Cover for Plano GPC38
Orchestra Total: B $8,684.00
Daysto Days to Days to
Item | Qty Choir Item Descriptions! Dellvery | PerUnit | Extended | Delivery | Per Unit} Extended { Delivery | Per Unit | Extended
Piano, 6' Ebony Grand Piano, Yamaha, Boston or Stelnway, padded cover
40 1
""""""""" for bench 40.00
41 2 Piano, Upright Plana - ebony finlsh, Yamaha, Boston, or Stelnway 40,00
Chalr Total: } -
Subtotal Pricing
Subtotal Band (1-24} $83,978,00 412095 $36,455.00
Subtetal { Orchestra 25-39) Na bid No bld $8,684.00
Subtotal Choir (40-41) No bid No bld Mo bid
Total: £83,978.00 4$120.95 $45,1.39.00
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