RFB # 8-020

T-Shirt,Polo, Denim, and Sweat Shirts

. You Name It . Screened Images, . Monograms & Lone Star
Fruit of the Loom . C.C. Creations g Screenprint Plus g Eagle Group Inc .
Custom Embroidery Inc. More Embroidery
Item Description Qty Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
T-shirt, Fruit of the Loom #593M or equal, short sleeve, 50% cotton/50% polyester,
1 |screen printed, 3 color logo on the front approximately 9” x 12”. Additional 2 color logo
" |on the upper center back approximately 4 x 10”, 45-50 characters on the front and back
logo. Children’s Sizes
Fruit of the Loom Hanes, FOL, or Port, Co. Fruit of the Loom
Brand name and number quoted: 5930BR Fruit of the Loom 5930 |Fruit of the Loom 593M Gildan #5930 FOL, Gildan, Jerzees Gildan 8000 FOL 5930 B Youth
700 -Dark $3.06 $2,142.00 $4.50 $3,150.00 $3.10 $2,170.00 $4.00 $2,800.00 $3.38 $2,366.00 $4.30 $3,010.00 $6.60 $4,620.00 $4.30 $3,010.00
$1.50 for re-
$0.25 $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.20 |order of 12 or| $0.00
Charge for XXL more
Quote per shirt for re-orders of above 12 or more: min. of 24 $11.79 $6.65 $4.10 $4.00 $4.38 $4.30 $7.50 $4.30
Total: $2,142.00 $3,150.00 $2,170.00 $2,800.00 $2,366.00 $3,010.00 $4,620.00 $3,010.00
T-shirt, Fruit of the Loom #593M or equal, short sleeve, 50% cotton/50% polyester,
5 |screen printed, 3 color logo on the front approximately 9” x 12”. Additional 2 color logo|
" |on the upper center back approximately 7 ¥4” x 11", 45-50 characters on the front and
back logo, Adult sizes
Hanes, FOL, Port & Co, Fruit og the Loom
Brand name and number quoted: Fruit of the Loom 5930R | Fruit of the Loom 5930 |Fruit of the Loom 593M Gidden #5930 FOL, Gildan, Jerzees Gildan 8000 FOL 5930
500 - Dark
& another $3.35 $1,675.00 $5.25 $2,625.00 $3.10 $1,550.00 | $5.00 $2,500.00 $3.38 $1,690.00 | $4.30  $2,150.00 $6.60 $3,300.00 $4.90 $2,450.00
color
Charge for XXL $0.95 $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
. ) min. of 24 $12.02 $6.95 $4.10 $5.00 $60.00 $4.38 $52.56 $4.30 $51.60 $7.50 $90.00 $4.90 $58.80
Quote per shirt for re-orders of above 12 or more (dark):
Quote per shirt for re-orders of above 12 or more (white): min. of 24 $11.36 $5.95 $3.90 $4.00 $48.00 $4.18 $50.16 $3.30 $39.60 $7.50 $90.00 $4.20 $50.40
Total: $1,675.00 $2,625.00 $1,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,690.00 $2,150.00 $3,300.00 $2,450.00
3. |T-shirt, Hanes, Heavyweight #5170 or equal, short sleeve, 50% cotton/50% polyester,
screened printed, 3 colors on front and 3 color on back, Adult Sizes
Brand name and number quoted: Fruit of the Loom 5930R Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170 Hanes #5170 FOL, Gildan, Jerzees Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170
300- Dark $3.75 $1,125.00 $5.55 $1,665.00 $3.10 $930.00 $4.00 $1,200.00 $3.92 $1,176.00 | $4.30  $1,290.00 $6.90 $2,070.00 $5.10 $1,530.00
150- White |  $3.39 $508.50 $4.55 $682.50 $2.90 $435.00 $3.50 $525.00 $2.90 $435.00 $3.30 $495.00 $6.90 $1,035.00 $4.45 $667.50
.95 dark,
Charge for XXL 75 wht $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
Quote per shirt] 50- Dark $8.69 $434.50 $7.95 $397.50 $4.10 $205.00 $5.00 $250.00 $4.92 $246.00 $4.30 $215.00 $6.90 $345.00 $5.10 $255.00
Quote per shirt] 25- White | $12.26 $306.50 $6.95 $173.75 $3.90 $97.50 $4.00 $100.00 $3.90 $97.50 $3.30 $82.50 $6.90 $172.50 $4.45 $111.25
.95 dark,
Charge for XXL 75 wht $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
Total: $2,374.50 $2,918.75 $1,667.50 $2,075.00 $1,954.50 $2,082.50 $3,622.50 $2,563.75
4. |T-shirt, Hanes, Heavyweight #5170 or equal, short sleeve, 50% cotton/50% polyester,
screened printed, 3 colors on front and 3 color on back, Children’s sizes
Brand name and number quoted: Fruit of the Loom 5930R Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170 Hanes 5170 Hanes #5170 FOL, Gildan, Jerzees Hanes 5170 Hanes 5370 Youth
650- Dark $3.55 $2,307.50 $4.85 $3,152.50 $3.10 $2,015.00 $4.00 $2,600.00 $3.72 $2,418.00 $4.30 $2,795.00 $6.90 $4,485.00 $4.45 $2,892.50
500- White | $2.88 $1,440.00 $4.30 $2,150.00 $2.90 $1,450.00 $3.50 $1,750.00 $2.70 $1,350.00 $3.30 $1,650.00 $6.90 $3,450.00 $4.25 $2,125.00
.95 for
dark, .75 $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $0.00
Charge for XXL for wht
Quote per shirt] 12- Dark No bid $7.95 $95.40 $4.10 $49.20 $4.00 $48.00 $4.72 $56.64 $4.30 $51.60 $6.90 $82.80 $4.45 $53.40
Quote per shirt] 12- White No bid $6.95 $83.40 $3.90 $46.80 $3.50 $42.00 $3.72 $44.64 $3.30 $39.60 $6.90 $82.80 $4.25 $51.00




Fruit of the Loom You Name I.t C.C. Creations el Screenprint Plus Monograms & Eagle Group Inc Lone _Star
Custom Embroidery Inc. More Embroidery
Item Description Qty Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $0.00
Total: $3,747.50 $5,481.30 $3,561.00 $4,440.00 $3,869.28 $4,536.20 $8,100.60 $5,121.90
5. |T-shirt, Hanes Beefy-T #5180 or equal, 100% cotton, minimum 6.1 oz., screen printed,
three color logo on front and three color logo on back, Children’s Sizes
Brand name and number guoted: No bid Hanes 5180 Hanes T5180 Hanes 5180 Hanes #5180 FOL, Gildan, Jerzees Hanes 5180 Hanes Beefy 5380 Youth
12- Dark $10.95 $131.40 $6.50 $78.00 $5.50 $66.00 $6.34 $76.08 $4.30 $51.60 $7.00 $84.00 $12.50 $150.00
50 - White $9.95 $497.50 $5.85 $292.50 $4.50 $225.00 $4.64 $232.00 $3.30 $165.00 $7.00 $350.00 $6.35 $317.50
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $0.00
Total: $628.90 $370.50 $291.00 $308.08 $216.60 $434.00 $467.50
Quote per shirt] 24- Dark $9.95 $238.80 $5.50 $132.00 $5.50 $132.00 $6.34 $152.16 $4.30 $103.20 $7.00 $168.00 $11.25 $270.00
Quote per shirt] 24- White $8.95 $214.80 $4.85 $116.40 $4.50 $108.00 $4.64 $111.36 $3.30 $79.20 $7.00 $168.00 $6.35 $152.40
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $0.00
Total: $0.00 $453.60 $248.40 $240.00 $263.52 $182.40 $336.00 $422.40
6 Sweat Shirt, Fruit of the Loom #1930 or equal, long sleeve, minimum 11 oz., screen
" |printed, 1 color logo on the front approximately 6”x6”, Adult Sizes
Fruit of the Loom
Brand name and number guoted: No bid Fruit of the Loom 82300 82300 12 oz FOL 82300 12 oz Jerzee 18012 Fruit of the Loom Sporttek F280 FOL 82300 12 oz
12 $14.95 $179.40 $13.95 $167.40 $13.00 $156.00 $10.84 $130.08 $13.85 $166.20 $16.80 $201.60 $12.00 $144.00
Charge for XXL $2.00 $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $179.40 $167.40 $156.00 $130.08 $166.20 $201.60 $144.00
7. | Sweat Shirt, Fruit of the Loom #1930 or equal, long sleeve, minimum 11 oz., screen|
printed, 3 color logo on the front approximately 6"x6 , Adult Sizes,
Fruit of the Loom
Brand name and number guoted: No bid Fruit of the Loom 82300 82300 12 oz FOL 82300 12 oz Jerzee 18012 Fruit of the Loom Sporttek F280 FOL 82300 12 oz
150 $13.95 $2,092.50 $12.85 | $1,927.50 | $12.50 $1,875.00 $9.84 $1,476.00 | $12.85 $1,927.50 | $17.50 | $2,625.00 $9.50 $1,425.00
12 $14.95 $179.40 $13.95 $167.40 $12.50 $150.00 $10.84 $130.08 $12.85 $154.20 $17.50 $210.00 $9.50 $114.00
Charge for XXL $2.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $2,271.90 $2,094.90 $2,025.00 $1,606.08 $2,081.70 $2,835.00 $1,539.00
g. |Polo T-shirt, Jerzees #J100 or equal, 100% cotton, embroidered, 1 color with color
thread, logo on the left chest with approximately 8,000 stitches, Adult Sizes
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Jerzees J100 Jerzees J100 Jerzee J100 Jerzee J100 Jerzees Jerzee J100 Jerzees J100
24- Dark $11.04 $264.96 $9.35 $224.40 $11.50 $276.00 $7.74 $185.76 $10.00 $240.00 $8.50 $204.00 $9.00 $216.00
12- White $9.90 $118.80 $8.75 $105.00 $11.50 $138.00 $6.93 $83.16 $9.50 $114.00 $8.50 $102.00 $8.25 $99.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
48- Dark $11.04 $529.92 $9.10 $436.80 $11.50 $552.00 $7.74 $371.52 $10.00 $480.00 $8.50 $408.00 $9.00 $432.00
24- White $9.90 $237.60 $8.50 $204.00 $11.50 $276.00 $6.93 $166.32 $9.50 $228.00 $8.50 $204.00 $8.25 $198.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $1,151.28 $970.20 $1,242.00 $806.76 $1,062.00 $918.00 $945.00
9. Polo T-shirt Jerzees J100 or equal, 100% cotton pique, embroidered, 1 color with 1 color
thread, logo on the left chest with approximately 8000 stitches, Adult sizes
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Jerzees 437M Jerzees J100 Jerzee J100 Jerzee J100 Jerzees J100 Jerzee J437 Jerzees J100
24- Dark $11.04 $264.96 $9.35 $224.40 $10.00 $240.00 $7.74 $185.76 $10.00 $240.00 $8.50 $204.00 $9.00 $216.00
12- White $9.90 $118.80 $8.75 $105.00 $10.00 $120.00 $6.93 $83.16 $9.50 $114.00 $8.50 $102.00 $8.25 $99.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $383.76 $329.40 $360.00 $268.92 $354.00 $306.00 $315.00
24- Dark $11.04 $264.96 $9.10 $218.40 $10.00 $240.00 $7.74 $185.76 $10.00 $240.00 $8.50 $204.00 $9.00 $216.00
12- White $9.90 $118.80 $8.50 $102.00 $10.00 $120.00 $6.93 $83.16 $9.50 $114.00 $8.50 $102.00 $8.25 $99.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $383.76 $320.40 $360.00 $268.92 $354.00 $306.00 $315.00
10. |Polo T-shirt, Jerzees J437 or equal 50% cotton, 50% polyester, embroidered with 3
colors on front, logo on the left chest with approximately 8000 stitches. Adult sizes
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Jerzees 437M Jerzees J437 Jerzee J437 Jerzee #437 Jerzees 437 Jerzee J437 Jerzees J437
12- Dark $13.70 $164.40 $9.95 $119.40 $12.50 $150.00 $9.45 $113.40 | $10.00 $120.00 $8.50 $102.00 $10.75 $129.00
6- White $12.41 $74.46 $9.50 $57.00 $12.50 $75.00 $8.64 $51.84 $9.50 $57.00 $8.50 $51.00 $10.00 $60.00




Fruit of the Loom You Name I.t C.C. Creations el Screenprint Plus Monograms & Eagle Group Inc Lone _Star
Custom Embroidery Inc. More Embroidery
Item Description Qty Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24- Dark $13.70 $328.80 $9.35 $224.40 $12.50 $300.00 $9.45 $226.80 $10.00 $240.00 $8.50 $204.00 $10.75 $258.00
12- White $12.41 $148.92 $8.75 $105.00 $12.50 $150.00 $8.64 $103.68 $9.50 $114.00 $8.50 $102.00 $10.00 $120.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $716.58 $505.80 $675.00 $495.72 $531.00 $459.00 $567.00
11. Polo T-shirt, Jerzees #J437 or equal, 100% cotton pique, embroidered with 1 color on
front, logo on the left chest approximately 8000 stitches. Adult sizes
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Jerzees 437M Jerzees J437 Jerzee J437 Jerzee #437 Jerzees 437 Jerzee J437 Jerzees J437
12- Dark $13.70 $164.40 $9.95 $119.40 $12.50 $150.00 $9.45 $113.40 $10.00 $120.00 $7.50 $90.00 $10.75 $129.00
6- White $12.41 $74.46 $9.50 $57.00 $12.50 $75.00 $8.64 $51.84 $9.50 $57.00 $7.50 $45.00 $10.00 $60.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24- Dark $13.70 $328.80 $9.35 $224.40 $12.50 $300.00 $9.45 $226.80 $10.00 $240.00 $7.50 $180.00 $10.75 $258.00
12- White $12.41 $148.92 $8.75 $105.00 $12.50 $150.00 $8.64 $103.68 $9.50 $114.00 $7.50 $90.00 $10.00 $120.00
Charge for XXL $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $716.58 $505.80 $675.00 $495.72 $531.00 $405.00 $567.00
Women's Denim Short Sleeve Work shirt, Wrangler or equal, minimum 6.5 oz., Light Blue|
12. |or Maroon, 100% cotton, button down color, no pocket, wood-tone buttons, hemmed
sleeves, embroidered with one color (maroon, blue, white) with CSISD (Department]
Name, ex. Purchasing, Human Resources) and CSISD emblem.
Port & Company Port & Company Wrangler or Port
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Port Authority LSP11 | Port & Company LSP11 Lightweight LSP11 #LSP11 Authority Port Authority SP10 Harriton M550W
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.50 $372.00 $16.00 $384.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.00 $360.00 $16.00 $384.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $787.68 $732.00 $768.00 $570.72 $792.00 $504.00 $696.00
Women's Denim Long Sleeve Work shirt, , Wrangler or equal, minimum 6.5 oz, Light Blue|
13. |or Maroon, 100% cotton, button down color, no pocket, wood tone buttons, hemmed
sleeves, embroidered with one color (maroon, blue, white), with CSISD (Department]
Name, ex. Purchasing, Human Resources) and CSISD emblem, long sleeve,
Port & Company Port & Company Wrangler or Port
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Port & Company LSP10 | Port & Company LSP10 Lightweight LSP10 #LSP10 Authority Port Authority SP10 Harriton M550W
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.50 $372.00 $16.50 $396.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.00 $360.00 $16.50 $396.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $787.68 $732.00 $792.00 $570.72 $792.00 $504.00 $696.00
Men’s Denim Short Sleeve Work shirt, , Wrangler or equal, minimum 6.5 oz, Light Blue,
14 100% cotton, button down color, left chest patch pocket, button down collar, wood-tone
" |buttons, hemmed sleeves, embroidered with one color (maroon, blue, white) with CSISD
(Department Name, ex. Purchasing, Human Resources) and CSISD emblem
Port and Company SP11] Port and Company Wrangler or Port
Brand name and number guoted: No bid Port & Company SP10 | Port & Company SP11 48 SP10 Authority Port Authority SP10 Harriton M550
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.50 $372.00 $16.50 $396.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.00 $360.00 $16.50 $396.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $787.68 $732.00 $792.00 $570.72 $792.00 $504.00 $696.00
Men’s Denim Long Sleeve Work shirt, Wrangler or equal Minimum 6.5 oz, Light Blue,
15. 100% cotton, button down color, left chest patch pocket, button down collar, wood-|
tone buttons, hemmed sleeves, embroidered with one color (maroon, blue,  white) with
CSISD (Department Name, ex. Purchasing, Human Resources) and CSISD emblem
Port and Company SP10| Port and Company Wrangler or Port
Brand name and number quoted: No bid Port & Company SP10 | Port & Company SP10 48 SP10 Authority Port Authority SP10 Harriton M550
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.50 | $372.00 $17.00 $408.00 $11.89 | $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 | $252.00 $14.50 $348.00




Fruit of the Loom You Name I.t C.C. Creations el Screenprint Plus Monograms & Eagle Group Inc Lone _Star
Custom Embroidery Inc. More Embroidery
Item Description Qty Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
24 $16.41 $393.84 $15.00 $360.00 $17.00 $408.00 $11.89 $285.36 $16.50 $396.00 $10.50 $252.00 $14.50 $348.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $787.68 $732.00 $816.00 $570.72 $792.00 $504.00 $696.00
Women's Moisture Management Shirt, Pro Celebrity KLM297, 100% polyester, cap|
16. |sleeves, 5 button pocket, embroidered with one color with CSISD (Department Name,
ex.Curriculum, Purchasing, Human Resources) and CSISD emblem.
Pro Celebrity KLM 297
No bid Pro Celebrity KLM297 | Pro Celebrity KLM297 48 Pro Celebrity KLM297 Pro Celebrity No bid Pro Celebrity KLM297
6 $30.35 $182.10 $23.50 $141.00 $38.00 $228.00 $21.65 $129.90 $22.95 $137.70 $25.75 $154.50
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $2.00
12 $30.35 $364.20 $22.95 $275.40 $38.00 $456.00 $21.65 $259.80 $22.95 $275.40 $25.75 $309.00
Charge for XXL $1.00 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.50 $2.00
Total: $0.00 $546.30 $416.40 $684.00 $389.70 $413.10 $463.50
17. Artwork, Camera Ready Artwork (as needed), one time charge
Per hour:]  Total: $40.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 NC $20.00 No response $40.00
18. Embroidery Digitizing (as needed)
Per logo:]  Total: No bid $50.00 $50-$75 $50.00 NC $75.00 No response $50.00
| | |
Conflict of Interest: Submitted not signed Complete Submitted not signed Not included Submitted not signed Complete No included Submitted not signed
Felony Conviction Notice: Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete Complete
_ _ N/A Not included 15% 25% 15-20% depending 20% No included 15%
Discount percentage and catalog for other apparel items | yearly| purchase |
additional .10 -.25 per Prg;?atrrrz:?aﬁ:felee:re
Delivery 20-25 days ARO additional color, . L
depending on shirt stlpulatloh_s in placg to
Notes: be qualified for this
Total Bid (Items 1-18): $9,979.00 $24,827.83 $17,825.70 $21,761.00 $17,196.16 $20,933.70 $27,859.70 $21,765.05




