

**AMU Bid Number:RFB 14-003**

Buyer: PAW

Fiscal Year: 2013

Cost Savings:  
Category:

Due Date: 08/01/14

Department: TRANSPORTATION

Terms  
F.O.B.  
Delivery  
Contact  
See Bid

**BRENCO**

**PETROLEUM TRADERS**

**TAC ENERGY**

**MANSFIELD**

**GOLD STAR PETROLEUM**

**HARTLAND FUEL**

Item Description	BRENCO		PETROLEUM TRADERS		TAC ENERGY		MANSFIELD		GOLD STAR PETROLEUM		HARTLAND FUEL	
	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION
1 GASOLINE, UNLEADED, 87 OCTANE TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (TTD)												
MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		7,000		7,500		8,000		8,000		8,600		8,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0230</b>		<b>0.0210</b>		<b>0.0066</b>		<b>0.0124</b>		<b>0.0279</b>		<b>0.0177</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON		2.9307		2.9287		2.9143		2.9201		2.9356		2.9254
CSISD TOTAL	40,000	117,228.00		117,148.00		116,572.00		116,804.00		117,424.00		117,016.00
2 GASOLINE, UNLEADED 87 OCTANE LESS THAN FULL TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY LIFTED												
MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		500.00		1,000		4,000		NO BID		500		8,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0900</b>		<b>0.1000</b>		<b>0.0316</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>0.6403</b>		<b>0.0177</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON		2.9977		3.0077		2.9393		NO BID		3.5480		2.9254
CSISD TOTAL												
3 #2 DIESEL, LOW SULFUR TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (TTD) MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		6,500		7,500		7,000		7,000		7,500		7,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0265</b>		<b>0.0408</b>		<b>0.0316</b>		<b>0.0295</b>		<b>0.0444</b>		<b>0.0333</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON		3.0081		3.0224		3.0123		3.0111		3.0260		3.0149
CSISD TOTAL	148,000	445,198.80		447,315.20		445,820.40		445,642.80		447,848.00		446,205.20
4 #2 DIESEL, LOW SULFUR, LESS THAN FULL TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (LTRTTD) MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		500		1,000		4,000		NO BID		500		7,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0900</b>		<b>0.1000</b>		<b>0.0530</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>0.6618</b>		<b>0.0333</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON		3.0716		3.0816		3.0346		NO BID		3.6434		3.0149
CSISD TOTAL	2,000	6,143.20		6,163.20		6,069.20		0		7,286.80		6,029.80
5 #2 DYED DIESEL, LOW SULFUR TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (TTD) MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		6,500		7,500		7,000		7,000		7,500		7,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0265</b>		<b>0.0408</b>		<b>0.3100</b>		<b>0.0350</b>		<b>0.0436</b>		<b>0.0333</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON		3.0122		3.0265		3.0167		3.0207		3.0293		3.0149
6 #2 DYED DIESEL LOW SULFUR LESS THAN FULL TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (LTTTD) MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:		500		1,000		4,000		NO BID		500		7,000
<b>PROFIT PER GALLON</b>		<b>0.0900</b>		<b>0.1000</b>		<b>0.0524</b>		<b>NO BID</b>		<b>0.6612</b>		<b>0.0333</b>
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON												

<b>Due Date: 08/01/14</b>
<b>Department: TRANSPORTATION</b>

	BRENCO	PETROLEUM TRADERS	TAC ENERGY	MANSFIELD	GOLD STAR PETROLEUM	HARTLAND FUEL
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	3.0757	3.0857	3.0381	NO BID	3.6489	3.0149
7 BIO-DIESEL LESS THAN TRANSPORT TRUCK DELIVERY (LTTD) MINIMUM LESS THAN TRANSPORT LOAD IN US GALLONS:	6,500	7500.00	NB	NO BID	5,000	7,000
PROFIT PER GALLON	0.0800	0.10	NB	NO BID	0.0816	0.0750
TOTAL UNIT PRICE PER GALLON	3.0585	3.08	NB	NO BID	3.0611	3.0545
Certification of Authorization	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Insurance	YES	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
Felony Conviction Notice	YES	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
OPIS Rack Sheet	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
HUB	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
References	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
<b>CSISD Total Items 1, 3 &amp; 4</b>	<b>\$568,570.00</b>	<b>\$570,626.40</b>	<b>\$568,461.60</b>	<b>\$562,446.80</b>	<b>\$572,558.80</b>	<b>\$569,251.00</b>

Notes:

Prior experience with all entities  
 Minimum order quantities lower than other bidders- 500 gallons for unleaded and Diesel

HUB packet not approved by TAMU.  
 Minimum order quantities 4,000 gal. for unleaded and diesel

No bid #4

Will not accept orders less than 7,000 gallons